
Van Buren County Road Commission
Contract Gravel
Tuesday, February 25, 2025 at 11:00 AM

Bid Tabulation Arlington Township Bangor Township
Bloomingdale 

Township Columbia Township Decatur Township Geneva Township Hamilton Township Keeler Township Lawrence Township Paw Paw Township
Pine Grove 
Township Porter Township Waverly Township

VBCRC Boudreau 
Pit

VBCRC Bangor 
Garage

VBCRC Bloomingdale 
Garage

2,500 2,500 3,500 3,000 500 1,000 5,000 3,000 3,000 5,000 2,000 30,000 10,000 3,500 1,600 2,000
Contractor Product Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton

Yerington 22A 21.25$                            15.10$                           21.50$                           14.50$                           14.76$                           15.95$                           
22A Mod 12.75$                           14.68$                           
23A 14.85$                                13.75$                           11.30$                           14.75$                            15.23$                              
23A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

High Grade 22A 14.34$                                15.67$                            13.67$                           13.67$                           15.00$                           15.00$                           17.00$                           17.40$                           15.94$                           15.67$                           14.34$                           17.00$                           13.67$                           15.14$                           15.67$                            13.67$                              
22A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23A 14.34$                                15.67$                            13.67$                           13.67$                           15.00$                           15.00$                           17.00$                           17.40$                           15.94$                           15.67$                           14.34$                           17.00$                           13.67$                           15.14$                           15.67$                            13.67$                              
23A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

H&H Contract Haulers22A 14.58$                                14.58$                            14.58$                           14.58$                           No Bid 14.58$                           14.58$                           14.58$                           12.80$                           12.80$                           14.58$                           13.80$                           13.80$                           14.58$                           14.58$                            14.58$                              
22A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23A 14.30$                                14.30$                            14.30$                           14.30$                           No Bid 14.30$                           14.30$                           14.30$                           14.30$                           11.40$                           14.30$                           14.30$                           14.30$                           14.30$                           14.30$                            14.30$                              
23A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MarJo Construction 22A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22A Mod 14.39$                                16.21$                            15.63$                           16.21$                           14.91$                           16.41$                           15.69$                           16.02$                           13.61$                           13.61$                           17.40$                           15.43$                           14.65$                           12.22$                           15.17$                            14.91$                              
23A 14.02$                                15.84$                            15.26$                           15.84$                           14.54$                           16.04$                           15.32$                           15.65$                           13.24$                           13.24$                           17.12$                           15.06$                           14.28$                           11.85$                           14.80$                            14.54$                              
23A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Holcim 22A 14.93$                           15.47$                            14.79$                              
22A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23A 14.93$                           15.47$                            14.79$                              
23A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kalin Construction 22A 18.53$                                18.79$                            20.11$                           20.36$                           14.35$                           21.40$                           14.61$                           15.92$                           16.98$                           17.22$                           21.32$                           16.70$                           19.57$                           16.96$                           19.05$                            20.10$                              
22A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23A 18.53$                                18.79$                            20.11$                           20.36$                           14.35$                           21.40$                           14.61$                           15.92$                           16.98$                           17.22$                           21.32$                           16.70$                           19.57$                           16.96$                           19.05$                            20.10$                              
23A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

R Smith & Sons 22A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22A Mod 13.75$                                13.95$                            16.38$                           17.25$                           16.00$                           16.38$                           17.25$                           17.25$                           14.63$                           13.23$                           17.25$                           15.50$                           15.50$                           11.93$                           15.23$                            15.36$                              
23A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

USA Earthworks 22A 16.00$                                16.00$                            16.00$                           16.00$                           NB 19.00$                           NB NB NB 17.50$                           16.00$                           NB 16.00$                           NB 16.00$                            16.00$                              
22A Mod 16.00$                                16.00$                            16.00$                           16.00$                           NB 19.00$                           NB NB NB 17.50$                           16.00$                           NB 16.00$                           NB 16.00$                            16.00$                              
23A 16.50$                                16.50$                            16.50$                           16.50$                           NB 19.50$                           NB NB NB 17.50$                           16.50$                           NB 16.50$                           NB 16.00$                            16.00$                              
23A Mod 16.50$                                16.50$                            16.50$                           16.50$                           NB 19.50$                           NB NB NB 17.50$                           16.50$                           NB 16.50$                           NB 16.00$                            16.00$                              

StoneCo. 22A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22A Mod 12.65$                                13.30$                            13.85$                           13.95$                           12.65$                           14.50$                           12.65$                           13.65$                           11.65$                           12.65$                           14.75$                           13.65$                           12.65$                           11.40$                           13.65$                            13.65$                              
23A 12.65$                                13.30$                            13.85$                           13.95$                           12.65$                           14.50$                           12.65$                           13.65$                           11.65$                           12.65$                           14.75$                           13.65$                           12.65$                           11.40$                           13.65$                            13.65$                              
23A Mod No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22A
22A Mod
23A
23A Mod
22A
22A Mod
23A
23A Mod


