
December 4, 2024 at 11:00 AM

Vendor Manufacturer Unit Price Unit Bidding Option

15W-40 J&H Oil Phillips 66 10.960$              Gallon 1

PriMar Petroleum Citgo 9.190$                Gallon 1

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 8.990$                Gallon 3*

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 8.500$                Gallon 1 and 2**

Crystal Flash Phillips 66 11.350$              Gallon 1

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 6.800$                Gallon 1

10W-30 J&H Oil Phillips 66 11.980$              Gallon

PriMar Petroleum Citgo 10.290$              Gallon

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 18.790$              Gallon

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 9.300$                Gallon

Crystal Flash 11.490$              Gallon

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 6.800$                 Gallon

Tractor Hydraulic Oil J&H Oil Phillips 66 10.400$              Gallon

PriMar Petroleum Citgo 9.690$                Gallon

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 11.990$              Gallon

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 7.250$                Gallon

Crystal Flash Phillips 66 11.460$              Gallon

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 6.250$                Gallon

Synthetic Auto Trans Fluid J&H Oil Phillips 66 26.770$              Gallon

PriMar Petroleum No Bid

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 31.100$              Gallon

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 23.010$              Gallon

Crystal Flash Citgo 24.550$              Gallon

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 1,535.000$        Drum

Overdrive HD#2 Extreme 

Pressure Grease J&H Oil Phillips 66 3.270$                120 Lb Drum

PriMar Petroleum Citgo 3.990$                120 Lb Drum

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 520.000$            120 Lb Drum

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 393.540$            120 Lb Drum

Crystal Flash Phillips 66 502.200$            120 Lb Drum

Safety-Kleen Systems No Bid

High Temp JT6 #2 Grease J&H Oil Phillips 66 3.270$                120 Lb Drum

PriMar Petroleum Citgo 3.990$                120 Lb Drum

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 520.000$            120 Lb Drum

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 406.340$            120 Lb Drum

Crystal Flash Phillips 66 502.200$            120 Lb Drum

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 470.000$            120 Lb Drum

High Temp JT#2 Grease J&H Oil Phillips 66 4.800$                35 Lb Bucket

PriMar Petroleum Citgo 3.990$                35 Lb Bucket

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 199.980$            35 Lb Bucket

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 112.380$            35 Lb Bucket

Crystal Flash Phillips 66 173.300$            35 Lb Bucket

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 145.000$            35 Lb Bucket

Bid Tabulation

Lubricants and Fluids

VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION



Grease (Lithium Complex #2) J&H Oil Phillips 66 33.300$              Tube

PriMar Petroleum Citgo 3.790$                Tube

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 3.500$                Tube

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 3.420$                Tube-cases of 10

Crystal Flash Phillips 66 4.150$                Tube

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 45.000$              10 Tube Case

85-140 Gear Lube J&H Oil Phillips 66 848.700$            55 Gallon Drum

PriMar Petroleum No Bid

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 1,145.000$        55 Gallon Drum

Rowleys Wholesale Service Pro 719.270$            55 Gallon Drum

Crystal Flash Pro 892.000$            55 Gallon Drum

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 800.000$            55 Gallon Drum

Bulk Fleetguard ES Compleat 

OAT Anti-freeze Coolant J&H Oil Starfire 8.710$                Gallon

PriMar Petroleum No Bid

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 7.870$                Gallon

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 5.200$                Gallon

Crystal Flash Defendal 7.750$                Gallon

Safety-Kleen Systems No Bid

Fleetguard ES Compleat OAT 

Anti-Freeze Coolant J&H Oil Starfire 412.500$            55 Gallon Drum

PriMar Petroleum No Bid

Major Brands Oil Co. Shell 435.000$            55 Gallon Drum

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 296.410$            55 Gallon Drum

Crystal Flash Peak Final Charge 548.100$            55 Gallon Drum

Safety-Kleen Systems Performance Plus 350.000$            55 Gallon Drum

Windshield Washer Fluid, all 

season, non-concentrate J&H Oil 179.850$            55 Gallon Drum

PriMar Petroleum No Bid

Major Brands Oil Co. Champion 126.330$            55 Gallon Drum

Rowleys Wholesale Service Pro 129.150$            55 Gallon Drum

Crystal Flash Peak 209.000$            55 Gallon Drum

Safety-Kleen Systems No Bid

Windshield Washer Fluid, all 

season, non-concentrate J&H Oil 3.380$                Gallon

PriMar Petroleum No Bid

Major Brands Oil Co. Champion 6/1 Gal CS 2.165$                Gallon

Rowleys Wholesale Service Pro 2.040$                Gallon

Crystal Flash Peak 3.710$                Gallon

Safety-Kleen Systems No Bid

Diesel Exhaust Fluid J&H Oil 1.910$                Gallon

PriMar Petroleum No Bid

Major Brands Oil Co.
Brenner-275 Gallon 

Tote Exchange 2.350$                Gallon

Rowleys Wholesale Purus 1.630$                Gallon

Crystal Flash Peak 1.890$                Gallon

Safety-Kleen Systems No Bid

*We will review every 90 days and notify you 30 days prior to any increase.

**We are ok with prepayment and delivery throughout the year if the county wishes to lock in pricing.

Bid Option 1: Remain in effect for 90 days from award-30 day notice option to increase.

Bid Option 2: Pre-Purchase

Bid Option 3: Remain in effect for 90 days from award.


